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If you love rugby, you’ll 
love Twickenham. Home to 
Twickenham Stadium and 
the World Rugby Museum, 
this pretty riverside town is 
well worth a visit, and only 
15 minutes away by car.

For even more shopping 
options, Kingston upon 
Thames is easily reachable 
by car or public transport. 
Home to over 500 stores, 
two shopping centres and a 
bustling market place, it’s 
the perfect place to shop ‘til 
you drop. A hub for art and 

something for everyone 
here, making it a great day 
out for all the family.

Popular places  
to explore
Fill your weekends visiting 
some of the other local 
attractions nearby.

Syon House and Park is one 
of the last great houses of 
London. Situated in 
beautiful countryside, it’s 
just a ten-minute drive or 
short bus journey away.

Richmond Park is a 
National Nature Reserve 
and the largest of London’s 
eight Royal Parks. You 
could be at this perfect 
location for leisurely walks 
and wildlife spotting in just 
25 minutes by car. 

A great day out for the 
whole family is the 
fascinating London 
Museum of Water and 
Steam. This collection of 

pumping engines is just  
up the road in Brentford.  
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